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INSTRUCTION IN 
THE NOBLE WORD 

OF ABDUL BAHA 
His fnswers to Questions 

About Universal Religion; 

Unity of Mankind 

Almost a year has passed since the 
death of Abdul Baha, fermer head of 

the Bahai church of the world. A 

temple is being built fer. the wor- 
shipers of this faith in Wilmette. 
Bahatiain is deseribed us the univer- 
sal religion, the fuith that) campre- 
henda all races, sects und betiefs. 
During hia lifetime Abdu! Buha was 

asked many questions regarding the 
movement by persons cager to knaw, 
So clear and useful were his answers 
that the followers of whe faith stil 
make use of them. Abdul Bahai mused 
to explain the Bahai movement ws 
“the spirit of this are.” 

Continuing, he would sav: "lt is 
the essence of all the tisghosxt idegis 
of this country. The couse is an in- 
clusive movement: the teuchings of 
al! the religions und sorietles oo - 
found here: the Christians, Jews. 
Buddhists, Mohammedans, Zoraas- 
trianeg, Theusophists,  Mreeinasans, 
Spiritualists and others find their 
highest aims in this cause—the se- 
clalists und philosopners tind their 
theories fully developed in Uhis moave- 
ment, 

“The objective uims of this cause 
are the oneness of the world of hu- 
Inanity; universal peuce: universal 
jove; international co-operation, reci- 
precity: the rvromedon ef the prin- 
ctile of hunwn consangculalty and 
sohidarity. and the establisxhinent of 
the kingdom of God, Urst in the 
hearts of nen and then upon curth.” 
Questions that are usked with 

freater concern, perhaps, of LPahais, 
tnan other questions, are: "What re- 
lation does the Lahai movement beor 
to Christianity’? What place does 
Christ hold in the Lahai religion’ 

These questions ure answered in 
the words uf Abdul isaha: 
“Baha ‘'UNah established Christ it: 

the East. He has praised Chrisi. 

honored Christ, exalted Him, called 
fiim ‘the Word of God, the Splrit of 
God!” raiged the name of Christ tu 
aupreme sumiunits of  elurification. 
Throughout the orlent Bahais have 
ilumined the lamp of Christ und 
spread His mention. 

“The cause of Baka ‘UHah is the 
same 2s the cause of Christ. It is the 
Sume temple and the same rfounda- 

tron. Both of these are the spiritual 
springtiines and the seasons of tbe 
soul-refreshing awakening and the 
tause of the renovation of the life 
of mankind. 

“In the coming of Christ the divine 

teachings were given in accordance 
with the infanes of the human race, 
The teachings of Raha ‘Utkin have 
the same obusae principles, lun are 
neenrding to the stage of the mu- 
tury oor the werld and the require- 
ments of this iNutained age.’ 
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